
Do you agree or disagree with the following statement? 

Parents are the best teachers.

Actually I think it would be better if we say said parents can be the best teachers,. 
to be the best teachers they need to have some other qualities. What they can 
learn teach us depends on what kind of persons they are; if they are intelligent, 
reliable, honest, kind, modest, hardworking.… they can teach us these qualities 
too.

 I mean they can teach us to be a good or bad persons; they can shape our 
personality; In order to shape it good well they themselves should be good.

 We should also consider that parents are not like the teachers in school or 
university,. what they teach us and how they teach is are completely different, 
they don’t teach us math or literature, as I mentioned before what we learn from 
them is the way of life, and how we learn it, is really complicated, you know 
sometimes children follow exactly their parents' way and sometimes they take 
exactly their opposite, I think this part is dependsed on children and how they 
interpreted their parents' actions. Children learn by watching parents’ actions and 
words, sometimes we see parents saying to their children to never lie and always 
try to be honest and they themselves lie whenever they think it’s needed, these 
contradictions in what they say and what they do could hurt children’s attitude 
toward their parents.

As you know  the way you take in your life is so important,. if you choose it right, 
when you get older and take a look at your life, you can be proud of what you’ve 
done and it’s really enjoying enjoyable to be satisfied of with what you’ve done in 
your life. Our parents can help us to make this happen so their role in our life is 
significant; nobody can deny it, but to be the best teachers, other factors is are 
also required for them.




